
Autumn 2021 ALERT 
 
Follow us on Facebook and our website: 
https://www.facebook.com/boatownersNSW/ 
https://www.boatowners.org.au/ 
 
 
Flood muck a hazard to boating and human health 

It has been a trying summer for us all, off and on the water, with many members unable 
to access their vessels on Pittwater due to the Avalon COVID cluster. And the recent 
storm event has been creating havoc along our waterways, affecting many who have 
vessels on the water or who live near our waterways. Let’s hope the usual beautiful 
autumn weather we are enjoying now will stick around. 
 
Wishing you a great time on the water doing what we like to do so much. 
 

 
Station Beach, Palm Beach, 26 March 2021 - Photo credit: Pam Rowlinson 

 
 
Hunter region BOA community 

Members in the Hunter region are in the process of reinstating the regional BOA 
community, to help boost involvement and representation. Initiatives like this are 
usually kicked off by a local issue affecting the area, as is the case here. As mentioned 
in the December ALERT, the Central Coast Council intends to make changes to the 
Toronto foreshore that would negatively affect water access for the broader boating 
community and the local Royal Motor Yacht Club. Your BOA has made submissions 
to the Council and continues to promote the interests of boat owners on this and other 
local issues. 
 
Should you wish to take a more active role in defending boating interests locally, 
please drop us an email. 



 

 
Toronto Royal Motor Yacht Club 

 
Manning River 

The BOA has been working with Mid North Coast locals in recent months calling upon 
the NSW government to examine the feasibility of a permanent entrance to the 
Manning River at Old Bar. 
 
On 3 March 2021, local member for Myall Lakes Stephen Bromhead MP and Deputy 
Premier John Barilaro MP announced that the government has committed the funding 
necessary for a detailed strategic business case, including technical feasibility 
assessment, for options to maintain a permanently navigable channel. This is a key 
step forward and good news for local boat owners. 
 

 
Manning River entrance at Old Bar 

 

Sydney Fish Markets and White Bay 

We are keeping a watchful eye on the proposed developments as this is going to affect 
boat owners with talk of permanently closing the old Glebe Island Bridge. At this stage, 
authorities are pretty guarded with their plans. 
 
 
Shell Cove Marina 

The new marina has been opened to the ocean and is due to be opened to the public 
in June this year. See the latest developments here. 
 



 
Commercial fish trap floats 

Once again, the issue of commercial fish trap floats presenting a potential navigation 
hazard to cruising recreational vessels off the NSW coast has attracted discussion in 
AFLOAT magazine. BOA’s contribution to the discussion can be viewed here: 
https://afloat.partica.online/afloat-magazine/afloat-march-2021/flipbook/4/ 
 
 
Committee participation 

With the increasing number of BOA members, we also face an increase in issues to 
be handled by your committee. If you are in a position to offer some of your time and 
expertise to assist with this, please let us know. Current issues include trailer parking 
and ramp access, boating access on the NSW North Coast and Lake Macquarie, and 
“end of life” vessel management in the wider Sydney region. 
 
Your committee meets on the third Tuesday of the month in the evenings on Zoom, or 
quarterly face to face in Five Dock with access to Zoom for those who find this more 
convenient. Please email the BOA office on admin@boatowners.org.au  
 

 
 

Surname   Code Mobile Email 

Management         

President         

de Jong Chris 2069 0402 038 171 c.dejong@bigpond.com 

Vice-President         

Wyeth Chris 2099 0417 206 226 chris@natlmarine.com.au 

Secretary         

McKay Joann 2088 0421 118 887 boansw@iprimus.com.au  

Treasurer     

McKinnon Andrew 2046 0412 401 102 andrew@oaansw.com.au 

          



Committee:         

Dennis Bruce 2065 0412 283 114 bruce_dennis7@yahoo.com.au 

Lee David 2073 0411 223 876 dj.lee@optusnet.com.au 

Miles David 1750 0403 115 010 dgtmiles@gmail.com 

Geddes Mitch 2108 0412 894 304 glades.bay@bigpond.com 

Frost David 2540 0414 543 602 david@delmech.com.au 

Childs Rod 2093 0410 358 138 rod1950@tpg.com.au 

          

Regions:         

NSW South         

Frost David 2540 0414 543 602 david@delmech.com.au 

NSW Far South         

Drenkhahn Fritz 2551 0427 359 820 fritzd@bigpond.com  

NSW Hunter         

Downing Frank 2077 0409 341 969 fdowning@bigpond.com 

Pittwater         

Moore Glenn 2106 0419 609 207 glennmoore@aurorabiosciance.com.au 

Botany         

Smith David 2234 0408 543 147 bdsmt40@bigpond.com 

 


